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Version 10.3 of Football Manager,
Football Manager 2010 v10.3.0, is
released to coincide with the
Barclays Premier League the
second tier of English football. It
is part of the FM Line-up of Sport
Simulators. The interface is the
same as that used by the PS3
version of the game. Football
Manager 2010 v10.3 is the second
major release in the FM Line-up.
The overall aim is to attempt to
make the game as realistic and
authentic as possible. Players can
be assigned tactics and team roles.
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The game is fully integrated with
your PES 2011 game save and is
updated automatically. FM
v10.3.0 The first major addition
to this new release is a revamped
computer management system.
The new system allows more
realistic simulation of a variety of
different scenarios. The feature
allows players to manage staff and
budgets, with many more features
than ever before available in a
computer game. The flexibility of
the new computer management
system is also intended to replicate
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the way a real manager would
manage their side. The biggest
feature in the new release of
Football Manager 2010 v10.3.0 is
the retention of a real time
relationship with players. The
transfer market is based on real
transactions at real time. Players
have the ability to provide a
request for a transfer in future. If
you succeed then the player will
have their price rise. FM v10.3.0
The game is also designed to have
a close relationship with a bespoke
podcast. The pod is called
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Football Manager Football
Opinion where pod hostÂ Errol
Craig, a long term football
manager and journalist visits a
variety of football clubs. Errol
records his views and interviews
others including leading football
figures. The podcast has become
so popular that the ITN network
will be producing a documentary
on the pod. Football Manager
2010 v10.3.0 Content The new
version is to be followed by a
series of smaller and sharper
patches. Players can expect
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further additions to the game over
the next few months. This new
major release adds a number of
features including: Improved
computer management. Upgraded
AI Manager. More accurate
display of playing staff with
different ages and roles. Improved
player awareness in a variety of
different environments and
circumstances. More realistic
match day. Improved mini-games.
Full community forums for those
that need to get answers to
questions. Improved presentation
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and animations. Raised reserve
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